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Completed training on EMERGENCY RESPONSE 
PLAN/AIRLINE DISASTER OPERATION MANAGEMENT 

INFOLKS GROUP 
Work period—23 oct 2019 to 31 jan 2023 

I am an energetic, ambitious person who has develope
a mature and responsible approach to any task that 
I undertake, or situation that I am presented with. As a 
graduate with three years' of experience in  data 
labelling and project management, I am excellent in 
working with others to achieve a certain objective on 
time and with excellence.

I am eager to be challenged in order to grow and 
further improve my IT skills. My greatest passion is in 
life is using my technical know-how to benefit other 
people and organisations.

Completed CRS”ENTER THE WORLD OF AMADEUS 

SSLC - KALLADI HIGHER SECONDARY SCHOOL 
MARCH 2014

+2 COMMERCE - KALLADI HIGHER SECONDARY 
SCHOOL MARCH 2016

DEGREE - BBA AVIATION MANAGEMENT 
NEHRU COLLEGE OF AERONAUTICS AND APPLIED 
SCIENCE YEAR-2019-2016

Earners of this certification have demonstrated the 
technical ability to perform travel industry transactions 
using Amadeus Selling Platform Connect. They can 
create air bookings in cryptic mode, price them and 
issue the tickets by adding mandatory or optional 
elements. They can also use the features available in 
Selling Platform Connect to make car and hotel 
bookings in graphical mode.
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